














"N:\! Projects\Coop Building\Revit\CO OP BUILDING R23.rvt"

2/19/2024 2:09:40 PM

PROJECT
SITE

/71 LOCATION MAP

s
T

-—— e e’

O [

 — —

/"2 "\ BUILDING KEY PLAN - LOWER LEVEL

|

SCOPE OF WORK

TRUE

AO000/ NOTTO SCALE

COMMON PATH OF TRAVEL = 34'

\

EXIT

\

——ii

=

—r
I N7
N
N/
’\%‘T
O)
7 O
— \\ Q\Y-
- ®

i

oxe

/"3 LIFE SAFETY PLAN - LOWER LEVEL

AO000/ NOTTO SCALE

A000/ NOTTO SCALE

COOP BUILDING
INTERIOR BUILD OUT

APPLICABLE CODES

PROJECT CONTACT LIST

GOVERNING CODES:

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

2020 MINNESOTA STATE BUILDING CODE | 2020 MN STATE FIRE CODE

(W/ AMENDMENTS)

2020 MINNESOTA ACCESSIBILITY CODE

2009 ICC/ANSI A117.1

2018 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CODE (IECC)
W/ 2020 MSBC AMENDMENTS

2012 LIFE SAFETY CODE - NFPA 101
2018 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

2020 MN STATE PLUMBING CODE
2020 MN STATE MECHANICAL CODE
2020 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE (NEC)

OCCUPANCY REQUIREMENTS

Building Info:

BUILDING CLASSIFICATION:
BLDG CONSTRUCTION TYPE: V-B
SPRINKLER SYSTEM: NONE
OCCUPANCY TYPE: B
ADJ. TENANT OCCUPANCY: NONE
OCCP. SEPARATION REQ'D: NONE

NON-SEPARATED

CLIENT

PMR, LLC.
CONTACT: PAUL MODEEN
EMAIL: PAUL@PMRCONTRACTORS.COM
PHONE: 952-292-2859

ARCHITECT

KAEDING ARCHITECTURE
CONTACT: JENNIFER KAEDING
ADDRESS: 235 WEST MAIN STREET, SUITE 201, WACONIA, MN 55387
EMAIL: JKAEDING@KAEDINGARCH.COM
PHONE: 952-451-9763

ARCHITECTURAL

A000 |LOCATION MAP, BUILDING KEY, LIFE SAFETY PLAN, CODE REVIEW

Space Description Sq. Ft.

Occupants

A200 |FLOOR PLAN & RAILING DETAILS

A300 |ENLARGED TOILET PLAN, ELEVATIONS, & TYPICAL MOUNTING HEIGHTS

BUSINESS GENERAL OFFICE 2,644

18

S.F./ 150

TOTAL LOWER LEVEL SQUARE FOOTAGE: | 2,644

TOTAL OCCUPANTS:

CODE REVIEW

EXITS REQUIRED: (PER IBC TABLE 1006.3.2)

EXITS PROVIDED:

DIAGONAL LENGTH: (PER IBC 1007.1.1)

77-11"

DISTANCE REQUIRED: (1/3 DIAGONAL LENGTH)

25-11"

DISTANCE PROVIDED:

67'-2"

MAX. ALLOWED COMMON PATH OF EGRESS TRAVEL:

100

(PER IBC TABLE 1006.2.1)

ACTUAL COMMON PATH OF EGRESS TRAVEL:

34

MIN. REQ'D. EXIT WIDTH: (PER IBC 1005.1) OCCUPANTS X .2

3.6"

ACTUAL EXIT WIDTH: # OF DOORS X 34"

68"

CORRIDORS RATING: (PER IBC TABLE 1020.1)

O HRS

PLUMBING REVIEW

Occupant Info:

OCCUPANCY TYPE: B
TOTAL OCCUPANTS: 18
OCCUPANTS PER SEX: 9

REQUIRED WATERCLOSETS PER SEX (PER IBC TABLE 2902.1)

M /F

1 PER 25 FOR THE FIRST 50

1 PER 50 FOR THE REMAINDER EXCEEDING 50

NUMBER OF WATERCLOSETS REQUIRED

NUMBER OF WATERCLOSETS PROVIDED

REQUIRED LAVATORIES PER SEX (PER IBC TABLE 2902.1)

1 PER 40 FOR THE FIRST 80

1 PER 80 FOR THE REMAINDER EXCEEDING 80

NUMBER OF LAVATORIES REQUIRED

NUMBER OF LAVATORIES PROVIDED

REQUIRED DRINKING FOUNTAINS (PER IBC TABLE 2902.1, SUB H)

1 PER 100

NUMBER OF HI/LO DRINKING FOUNTAINS PROVIDED

IS THE REQUIRED (1) SERVICE SINK PROVIDED (PER IBC TABLE 2902.1, SUB E)

N/A

235 W. MAIN STREET, SUITE 201
WACONIA, MN 55387
952.451.9763

PROJECT INFORMATION:

COOP BUILDING
INTERIOR BUILD OUT

102 LAKE STREET W
COLOGNE, MN 55322

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS PLAN, SPECIFICATION,
OR REPORT WAS PREPARED BY ME OR UNDER MY
DIRECT SUPERVISION AND THAT | AM A DULY
LICENSED ARCHITECT UNDER THE LAWS OF THE
STATE OF MINNESOTA.

JENNIFER KAEDING, AlA
51456 2.20.24
REGISTRATION # DATE

ISSUE RECORD:

1/26/24 PERMIT SET
I\ 2/19/24 REVISION

PROJECT: COOPBLDGOFFICES
DATE: 2/19/24
DRAWN BY: BBAKER

CHECKED BY: JKAEDING

SHEET NAME:

LOCATION MAP,
BUILDING KEY, LIFE SAFETY
PLAN, CODE REVIEW

SHEET NUMBER:

1 A00O



"N:\! Projects\Coop Building\Revit\CO OP BUILDING R23.rvt"

2/19/2024 2:09:40 PM

CONSTRUCTION LEGEND

| | EXISTING CONSTRUCTION TO REMAIN

VESTIBUL I | NEW CONSTRUCTION
r P NEW CONSTRUCTION - PARTIAL HEIGHT WALL

FLOOR PLAN GENERAL NOTES

1. ALL PARTITIONS IN EXCESS OF 30" LENGTHS SHALL HAVE FULL HEIGHT CONTROL
JOINTS INSTALLED WITH MAXIMUM 30" SPACING.

2. NEW PARTITIONS TO ALIGN WITH EDGE OF EXISTING WINDOW FRAME/SILLS OR

EXISTING WALLS/COLUMNS UNLESS DIMENSIONED OTHERWISE. 235 W. MAIN STREET, SUITE 201
3. NEW PARTITIONS AT WINDOWS TO BE CENTERED ON MULLION UNLESS OTHERWISE WACONIA, MN 55387
DIMENSIONED. 952.451.9763

4. PLUMBING CONTRACTOR TO PROVIDE DESIGNER W/ CUT SHEETS FOR FINAL
APPROVAL OF ALL FIXTURES PRIOR TO ORDERING.

PROJECT INFORMATION:

COOP BUILDING
INTERIOR BUILD OUT

5. ANY EXPOSED SINK PIPES TO BE WRAPPED TO MEET A.D.A. REQUIREMENTS.
6. ALL NEW WATER SUPPLY PIPING TO BE TYPE "L" WATER PIPING.

UTILITY 7. MECHANICAL CONTRACTOR TO REVIEW ALL THERMOSTAT LOCATIONS W/

6'-41/2"

DESIGNER PRIOR TO INSTALLATION.
C()/I\gESE:I\éCE 71 0" 8. ALL FLOOR DRAINS SHALL BE CONNECTED TO THE SANITARY SEWER SYSTEM
(__ 9. VENTILATION (UMC) AND HEAT SOURCE TO MAINTAIN A TEMPERATURE ABOVE A
o MINIMUM OF 55°F
2.3] ~ 7 10.  ALL OUTSIDE CORNERS OF MILLWORK COUNTER TOPS ARE TO BE EASED.

1. S INDICATES NO WORK IS TO BE COMPLETE IN DESIGNATED AREAS.

26-4" 5-5"

!
|
|
[ | : :
i QL i | TOILET [
|
|

\“

102 LAKE STREET W
WALL PARTITION TYPES COLOGNE, MN 55322

1

7'-11

***TYPICAL PARTITION TO BE |C | U.N.O.

1'-0" ***USE MOISTURE RESISTANT GYP.BD. IN ALL WET AREAS SUCH AS RESTROOMS OR

7 SHOWERS (EXAMPLE)

S
— PARTITIONS (METAL STUDS)
NEW WOODEN HANDRAIL 47/8"

5

B A F" 3-0"
S =
LOBBY o COATS LI 7

" : :/ 5/8" GYP. BD. EACH SIDE

OFFICE
73

12'-41/2
-2

N | HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS PLAN, SPECIFICATION,
—-——

MAIN LEVEL A . 15 OR REPORT WAS PREPARED BY ME OR UNDER MY

. 102'-3" o o o - ] { DIRECT SUPERVISION AND THAT | AM A DULY
¢ 41 3.1/2" SOUND ATT. BATT INS. LICENSED ARCHITECT UNDER THE LAWS OF THE
COFFEE 1= STATE OF MINNESOTA.
| ) 4] 3.5/8"MIL. STUD @ 16" O.C.
JENNIFER KAEDING, AIA
| ' : =1 NON-RATED INSULATED
: P e ] ] 22 GATO GO 6" ABOVE GRID 51456 2.20.24
REGISTRATION # DATE
250 - ] FLOOR PLAN KEYED NOTES
: . PROVIDE NEW 3'-0" X 7'-0" SOLID WOOD DOOR & HOLLOW METAL FRAME ISSUE RECORD:
23] OFFICE = .
1-0 PROVIDE NEW 6'-0" X 7'-0" DOUBLE GLASS DOOR & ALUMINUM FRAME

5-61/2

(o]

12'-41/2

NEW WINDOW 1/26/24  PERMIT SET
PROVIDE NEW 18'D PLAM COAT SHELF & ROD A\ 2/19/24  REVISION
PROVIDE NEW 3-0" X 7'-0" STOREFRONT GLASS DOOR W/ GLASS SIDELITE

PROVIDE NEW STAINLESS STEEL SINGLE BASIN SINK W/ KITCHEN FAUCET & LEVER
HANDLES

PROVIDE NEW PLAM BASE CABINET W/ SOLID SURFACE COUNTER TOP @ 2'-10"
AFF. & PLAM UPPER CABINETS

ECIR . PROMIDEREQUIREDYVEN]I PQWER

R
N

S

CONFERENEE ¥

F——— m - -

BASEMENT

240~ 91-10"

N[ NN ] N |
oo | N[ oy O] ] IN] ]

% 2.9 > | PROVIDE NEW WOODEN HANDRAIL @ EXISTING STAIR Z 1
= | - /"2 "\ SECTION @ EXISTING WOOD STAIR
23] 7 \A200/ 3/8'=1-0"
OFFICE Q
Ny i
T = VN |
14-4" o4 5-8" e 2
> |1 STORAGE! /\

0oy ] ]

T 1-1/2"

— S—H

i v « MN.

[ I
T&L NEW WOODEN HANDRAIL
m ' m AN — PROJECT:  COOPBLDGOFFICES
RECORDS n DATE: 2/19/24
OPEN DRAWN BY: BBAKER
OFFICE . CHECKED BY: JKAEDING
o SHEET NAME:
= ¥ FLOOR PLAN & RAILING
2 N DETAILS
STORAGE I
(2.6
% BASEMENT B
FURN [ E—— T B ~
%L P SHEET NUMBER:

N
/"1 FLOOR PLAN - LOWER LEVEL /"3 "\ SECTION @ EXISTING CONCRETE STAIR /"4 "\ SECTION @ HANDRAIL @ AQOO

@ ]/4|| - -ll_on @ 3/8” - -ll_on W -l ]/2“ - -ll_on



"N:\! Projects\Coop Building\Revit\CO OP BUILDING R23.rvt"

2/19/2024 2:09:41 PM

__________ 24" X 36" FRAMED MIRROR f R g ’ COATHOOK
TOILET N : L
A | v g
M SOLID SURFACE COUNTER TOP & PLAM ~ [ T 4 — 1 PAPER TOWEL
- 5 3 APRON W/ INTEGRAL UNDERMOUNT SINK | 7 DISPENSER
| /
- 181 :
| 4 o
LZD (;D GRAB BARS LZD H | i LZD @ s A SOAP DISPENSER
= GRAB BARS = = I = N/ - |, SOLID SURFACE
O , 1 O SANITARY NAPKIN DISPOSAL O ' O N ¢ COUNTER TOP & PLAM
9 2e ,J/ 30t - L9 BOBRICK: B-270 ©l 9 I 9 N =5 APRON W/ INTEGRAL
T | Z | Z | Z ! | Z N UNDERMOUNT SINK
‘ < E‘@ﬁ © < TOILET PAPER DISPENSER < [ Z = N
z z BOBRICK: B-4288 z | z SERN
w w w | L ~ N
= = FLOOR-MOUNTED FLUSH = [ | SHOWER INSERT = N
- FLOOR-MOUNTED FLUSH VALVE TOILET VALVE TOILET | N
N | snmeeasews
. ~a—|— &"H TILE BASE W/ SCHLUTER COVED BASE J —a—|— SHOWER INSERT R # | —=—|— 4"H TILE BASE W/ SCHLUTER COVED BASE | - N - ;ig‘ELUTER COVED
N N N N
6'H TILE BASE W/ \ SHOWER INSERT
SCHLUTER COVED BASE
/"1 ENLARGED TOILET PLAN /"2 "\ TOILET /"3 "\ TOILET /"4 "\ TOILET /"5 "\ TOILET
A300/ 1/4"=1-0" A300/ 3/8"=1-0" A300/ 3/8"=1-0" A300/ 3/8'=1'-0" A300/ 3/8"=1-0"
NOTE:
MINNESOTA ACCESSIBILITY CODE
/// (MAC) TAKES PRECEDENCE OVER ANY
54" MIN. 42" MAX. DISCREPANCIES SHOWN.
39-41" (40" ) , 42" MAX. [, ANY PROTRUDING 36" MAX. — ANY FLUSH OR ALL DIMENSIONS FROM FINISHED
) ) DISPENSER MUST BE - RECESSED DISPENSER SURFACE. UN.O
12 24" MIN. MOUNTED WITHIN THE 24" MIN. MUST BE MOUNTED A
MAX. DASHED AREA SHOWN WITHIN THE DASHED ANY VARIATIONS NOTED ON PLANS
" AREA SHOWN ‘
-~ . ] . // FIXTURES AND ACCESSORIES SHOWN
2 8z az | 77 8" MIN. - —— - — FOR REFERENCE ONLY. SEE PLANS FOR
341 42", - E - E | —9 ; ACTUAL FIXTURES AND SPECIFICATIONS.
| ) R - ) L I 1 R
_ S S =) —¥ -+, > — NOT ALL DETAILS MAY APPLY.
I = e Z O =2 >
2 S5 |7 EAPE % E <
% =2 | % < Z / = < g
3 L3 o~ 5= ¢ ~ 2 : x
™ = o | ™ \\ - O NI= o/ > 3
RN %) o — = e <
— | © 2 z : / > s
|2 Q < TS ; :
i ™ /// 7 | Z A
sl T = ~
| 60" MIN. CLEAR 16-18" | 48" MIN. CLEAR | 15" 1 & 13 1/2"
7 4 . .
(17") MIN. MIN. MAX. MIN.
REAR WALL GRAB BAR SIDE WALL GRAB BARS DISPENSERS AND SANITARY PRODUCT RECEPTACLES LAVATORY / MIRROR KNEE & TOE CLEARANCE URINAL DRINKING FOUNTAIN
Al17.1 604.5.2 MSBC CH. 1341 A117.1 604.5.1 MSBC CH. 1341 A117.1 604.7 MSBC CH. 1341 A117.1 606.3 A117.1 306 Al117.1 602
m TYPICAL MOUNTING HEIGHTS - PLUMBING
A300/ 1/2"=1-0"
56" MIN. | Yoo | | N |
Aﬁ e N ‘ } ‘* ]2 MlN ‘ r "7 “* ]2 MlN ‘
| | oz ‘ oz => | | -
} } \ > } \ = } \ r \F j‘
T 4 1 » e : ] <]
48" MIN. CLEAR 3 e - f) i 18" MIN | | | | VNI | | P | |
- | SN o Q / | L | \ [ % | 24"
s \ N s ‘ 4 \ 1 \ \ <
P : . - | 1 - — : N MIN
/ | \\\ ar —— — ! ! | | \ } }
/ 1 ST i L | 1 1 [ | i
° / N/ ~ N\ .
/ S : | | |
R ABCDEF / ‘ “JQ// (N _E ‘ ‘ ‘
T 4 S — % _ I = . [Ee== / O MM DA S \ 3 | FRONT APPROACH, PUSH SIDE | HINGE APPROACH, PUSH SIDE i
b = . L SN N } (*IF CLOSER & LATCH ARE PROVIDED) } (*IF CLOSER & LATCH ARE PROVIDED) } LATCH APPROACH, PULL SIDE
» ~ FRONT APPROACH PULL SIDE } } (**48" MIN |[F CLOSER & LATCH PROVIDED) } (*54" MIN IF CLOSER IS PROVIDED)
< - 0~ oot~y -
<| <| O o < < < < N < | T\ T \T
o < O oo o o o o ~ o 5‘ . >< 5 - - | | N - |
MR 3| E ¥ ¥ N y 5 5|z 2| < = | B O Sz - |
<= <3 < < < < I <5 z|Z © | | | > | = | |
= = = = o = = <| = S CoN IS z | | ! ~ | | \ N } g } \
| 3 ) o) ) o N ) ) z| < o = \ \ } = \ \ | ~ ! }
? g ? ? 2 2 Z s ? 0 | 3 AN TR ‘
oo =l % 3 | 36"MIN | S | . A2'MIN | | e ! !
Lz S @ } N ’} } 0 | 2 } i }
! ! | |
| | | | | | |
— 1 o —10 I | |
| | |
COAT COAT PAPER TOWEL SPECIMEN ELECTRICAL LIGHT THERMOSTAT POWER FIRE SIGNAGE } } LATCH APPROACH, PUSH SIDE }
HOOKS SHELF DISPENSER PASS-THRU RECEPTACLE SWITCH DOOR EXTINGUISHER HINGE APPROACH, PULL SIDE } HINGE APPROACH, PULL SIDE } (*48" IF CLOSER IS PROVIDED) }
OPENER ! ! !

/7 "\ TYPICAL MOUNTING HEIGHTS - MISC

/8 "\ TYPICAL TOILET ROOM CLEAR FLOOR SPACES

/79 MANEUVERING CLEARANCE @ MANUAL DOORS

@ 1/2"=1-0"

@ 1/2"=1-0"

w 1/4"=1-0"

235 W. MAIN STREET, SUITE 201

WACONIA, MN 55387

952.451.9763

PROJECT INFORMATION:

COOP BUILDING
INTERIOR BUILD OUT

102 LAKE STREET W
COLOGNE, MN 55322

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS PLAN, SPECIFICATION,
OR REPORT WAS PREPARED BY ME OR UNDER MY
DIRECT SUPERVISION AND THAT | AM A DULY
LICENSED ARCHITECT UNDER THE LAWS OF THE
STATE OF MINNESOTA.

51456

JENNIFER KAEDING, AIA
2.20.24

REGISTRATION #

DATE

ISSUE RECORD:

1/26/24

PERMIT SET

I\ 2/19/24

REVISION

PROJECT:

DATE:

DRAWN BY:

COOPBLDGOFFICES
2/19/24

BBAKER

CHECKED BY: JKAEDING

SHEET NAME:

ENLARGED TOILET PLAN,
ELEVATIONS, & TYPICAL
MOUNTING HEIGHTS

SHEET NUMBER:

1 A300



Collaborative Planning, LLC

Memorandum

To: Honorable Mayor and Council

From: Cindy Nash, AICP, EDFP

Date: March 7, 2024

Subject: Ordinance Amendment — Expansion of Non-conforming Uses and CUP Process

The City has initiated an ordinance amendment related to non-conforming uses and conditional use
permits.

The purpose of the change to the section on non-conforming uses is to propose an opportunity for legal
non-conforming uses to expand their use and buildings. In particular, much of the historic core of the
community is zoned C-2 but currently contains homes and other non-commercial uses that currently
would be prevented from expanding under the existing ordinance. This amendment would provide a
one-time opportunity for people to make those expansions. As drafted, it would be permitted after
review by the Planning Commission and City Council with an application for a Conditional Use Permit.

The Zoning Ordinance does not currently contain a process for applying for and making a decision on
a Conditional Use Permit. This draft ordinance also creates that process.

A redline version of an ordinance amendment is attached for review and consideration. At their March
meeting, the Planning Commission recommended approval of the ordinance amendment.

PO Box 251, Medina, MN 55340 1
763-473-0569



§ 153.007 NONCONFORMING USES AND STRUCTURES.

Any structure or use existing upon the effective date of the adoption of this chapter which
does not conform to the provisions of this chapter may be continued subject to the
following conditions:

(A) The nonconforming use is not expanded or enlarged, unless approved by a
Conditional Use Permit subject to the following:

a. The footprint of the building containing the use may be permitted to be
expanded by not more than 50% a single time. Additional expansions are not
permitted.

b. The use is an existing legal nonconforming use.

c. The proposed expansion must be in compliance with all performance
standards contained within Chapter 153 of the City Code unless a variance has
been granted by the City under the procedures set forth in Section § 153.090 .

d. The Conditional Use Permit is recorded and specifically restricts the future
expansion of the building(s) on the subject property unless the use is changed
to a conforming use.

(B) Ifanonconforming use is discontinued or a nonconforming structure is abandoned
for a period of one year, further use of the structure or property must conform to this
chapter.

(C) Ifanonconforming use is replaced by another use, the new use shall conform to this
chapter.

(D) Ifanonconforming use or structure is damaged by any cause to the extent that
repair or replacement costs exceed 50% of the market value, the use or structure may not
be replaced or repaired except in conformity with this chapter.

(E) Normal maintenance of a nonconforming structure is permitted, including necessary
non-structural repairs and incidental alterations which do not extend or intensify the
nonconforming use.

(Ord. 150, passed 2-22-2000; Ord. passed 3--2007)



Sec. 153.094. Conditional use permits.

(1) Purpose. Certain uses identified as conditional uses for a particular zoning district,
while generally not suitable in a particular zoning district, may under some
circumstances be suitable if conditions are attached. When such circumstances exist, a
conditional use permit may be granted. Conditions may be applied to issuance of the
permit and a periodic review of the permit may be required. The permit shall be
granted for a particular use and not for a particular person.

(2) Criteria for granting conditional use permits. In granting a conditional use permit, the
city council shall consider the advice and recommendations of the planning
commission and the effect of the proposed use upon the health, safety, morals and
general welfare of occupants of surrounding lands. Among other things, the city
council shall make the following findings where applicable:

A.

The establishment, maintenance, or operation of the conditional use will not be
detrimental to or endanger the public health, safety, comfort or general welfare.

The conditional use will not be injurious to the use and enjoyment of other
property in the immediate vicinity for the purpose already permitted, nor
substantially diminish and impair property values within the neighborhood.

The establishment of the conditional use will not impede the normal and orderly
development and improvement of surrounding property for uses permitted in the
district.

Adequate utilities, access roads, drainage and necessary facilities have been or
will be provided.

Adequate measures have been or will be taken to provide ingress or egress so
designated as to minimize traffic congestion in the public streets.

The use of the property shall, in all respects other than the conditional use,
conform to the applicable regulations of the district in which it is located.

(3) Additional conditions.

A.

In permitting a new conditional use or the alteration of an existing conditional
use, the city council may impose, in addition to these standards and requirements
expressly specified by this chapter, additional conditions which the planning
commission considers necessary to protect the best interest of the surrounding
area or the community as a whole. These conditions may include, but are not
limited, to the following:

a. Increasing the required zoning lot size and setback dimension.
b. Limiting the height, size or location of structures.
c. Controlling the location and number of vehicle access points.
d. Increasing the street width.

Increasing the number of required off-street parking spaces.
f.  Limiting the number, size, location or lighting of signs.



g. Requiring diking, fencing, screening, landscaping or other facilities to protect
adjacent or nearby property.

h. Designating sites for open space.
i.  Placing hours of operation restrictions on the proposed use.

Any change involving structural alterations, enlargement, intensification of use, or
similar changes not specifically permitted by the conditional use permit issued
shall require an amended conditional use permit and all procedures shall apply as
if a new permit were being issued. The administrator shall maintain a record of all
conditional use permits issued including information on the use, location, and
conditions imposed by the city council, time limits, review dates, and such other
information as may be appropriate.

(4) Procedure.

A.

The person applying for a conditional use permit shall fill out and submit to the
city clerk the conditional use permit application form signed by the owner, site
plan, and other such information necessary to review the application for
compliance with this Ordinance, and such submittal shall include all information
as required on the application form unless a waiver of certain information is
granted by the city clerk.

The city clerk shall determine if the application is complete and, if complete, refer
the application to the planning commission.

The planning commission shall hold a public hearing on the application. Notice of
the public hearing shall be published in the official newspaper designated by the
city at least ten days prior to the hearing. Notice of the hearing shall also be
mailed to owners of property located within 350 feet of the outside boundaries of
the land to which the conditional use will be applicable if the conditional use
permit is for an area of five acres or less. The notice shall include a description of
the land and the proposed conditional use.

The report of the planning commission shall be placed on the agenda of the city
council following referral from the planning commission. In the event that the
planning commission does not make a recommendation on an application within
60 days of the date that the application was determined to be complete under
M.S.A. § 15.99, then the application shall automatically be referred to the city
council for a public hearing if a public hearing was not previously completed by
the planning commission.

An amended conditional use permit application shall be administered in a manner
similar to that required for a new conditional use permit. Amended conditional
use permits shall include request for changes in conditions, and as otherwise
described in this chapter.

No application for a conditional use permit shall be resubmitted for the same
property and for the same type of conditional use for a period of one year from
the date of a decision of the city council to deny an application. A conditional use



permit shall expire and be considered null and void one year after it has been
issued if no construction has begun.

If a time limit or periodic review is included as a condition by which a conditional
use permit is granted, the conditional use permit may be reviewed at a hearing
with notice of said hearing provided to the current property owner of record by
first-class mail at least ten days prior to the hearing; it shall be the responsibility
of the clerk to schedule such hearings and the owner of land having a conditional
use permit shall not be required to pay a fee for said review. A hearing for annual
review of a conditional use permit may be required at the discretion of the city
council.

In the event that the any of the conditions of the CUP are violated, the city has
authority to revoke the conditional use permit.

a. Aviolation of any condition set forth in a conditional use permit shall be a
violation of this Ordinance. If within 30 days of written notice from the city
the violation has not been corrected, the city may pursue the following
procedure to terminate the permit:

(i) Written notice of revocation shall be served upon the owner at least ten
working days prior to the Conditional Use Permit being revoked.

(ii) Notice to the owner on record shall be served personally or by first class
mail. Such written notice of revocation shall contain the effective date of
the revocation, the nature of the violation constituting the basis of the
revocation, the facts which support the conclusions that a violation has
occurred and a statement that if the Owner desires to appeal, the appeal
must, within ten working days, exclusive of the day of service, file a
request for a hearing.

(iii) The hearing request shall be in writing, stating the grounds for appeal
and served personally or received by first class mail by the city clerk at
the city hall not later than 4:30 p.m. of the tenth city working day
following notice of revocation.

(iv) Following the receipt of a request for hearing, the city council shall set a
time and place for the hearing within thirty days of receipt of the
hearing request.

Any use permitted under the terms of any conditional use permit shall be
established and conducted in conformity to the terms of such permit and of any
conditions designated in connection therewith. The city may, at its discretion,
review the property periodically to determine compliance with the terms of the
conditional use permit. Conditional Use Permits shall remain in effect for so long
as the conditions agreed upon are observed, provided that nothing in this section
shall prevent the city council from enacting or amending official controls to
change the status of conditional uses.



PUBLIC NOTICE

CITY OF COLOGNE
CARVER COUNTY
STATE OF MINNESOTA

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE CITY OF COLOGNE ZONING

ORDINANCE RELATED TO EXPANSION OF NON-CONFORMING USES AND

CONDITIONAL USE PERMITS

The City Council for the City of Cologne, Carver County, Minnesota, hereby ordains that on the 11th day of March
2024, that the City Council for Cologne adopted the above Ordinance. Due to the lengthy content of the Ordinance,
a brief summary follows:

Section 1.

Section 2.
Section 3.

Section 4.

ATTEST:

Section 153.007 of the Cologne Zoning Ordinance is hereby rescinded and a new Section 153.007
is added.

Section 153.094 of the Cologne Zoning Ordinance is added.

EFFECTIVE DATE. This ordinance becomes effective on the date of its publication, or upon the
publication of a summary of the ordinance as provided by Minn. Stat. § 412.191, subd. 4, as it
may be amended from time to time, which meets the requirements of Minn. Stat. § 331A.01, subd.
10, as it may be amended from time to time.

REPEALER All prior ordinances to the extent that they are inconsistent with the terms and
provisions of this Ordinance, shall be deemed repealed after the effective date of this Ordinance
with regard to those inconsistent terms and provisions.

/s/ Matt Lein, Mayor

/s/ Michelle Morrison, Clerk



CITY OF COLOGNE
CARVER COUNTY
STATE OF MINNESOTA

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE CITY OF COLOGNE ZONING ORDINANCE
RELATED TO EXPANSION OF NON-CONFORMING USES AND CONDITIONAL
USE PERMITS

The City Council of Cologne, Minnesota ordains:

SECTION 1. RESCIND AND REPLACE SECTION. Section 153.007 of the Cologne Zoning
Ordinance is hereby rescinded and a new Section 153.007 is added as follows:

§ 153.007 NONCONFORMING USES AND STRUCTURES.

Any structure or use existing upon the effective date of the adoption of this chapter
which does not conform to the provisions of this chapter may be continued subject to the
following conditions:

(A) The nonconforming use is not expanded or enlarged, unless approved by a
Conditional Use Permit subject to the following:

a. The footprint of the building containing the use may be permitted to be
expanded by not more than 50% a single time. Additional expansions are
not permitted.

b. The use is an existing legal nonconforming use.

c. The proposed expansion must be in compliance with all performance
standards contained within Chapter 153 of the City Code unless a variance
has been granted by the City under the procedures set forth in Section §
153.090 .

d. The Conditional Use Permit is recorded and specifically restricts the future
expansion of the building(s) on the subject property unless the use is
changed to a conforming use.

(B) If a nonconforming use is discontinued or a nonconforming structure is abandoned
for a period of one year, further use of the structure or property must conform to this
chapter.

(C) If anonconforming use is replaced by another use, the new use shall conform to
this chapter.



(D) If anonconforming use or structure is damaged by any cause to the extent that
repair or replacement costs exceed 50% of the market value, the use or structure may not
be replaced or repaired except in conformity with this chapter.

(E) Normal maintenance of a nonconforming structure is permitted, including
necessary non-structural repairs and incidental alterations which do not extend or
intensify the nonconforming use.

SECTION 2. ADD NEW SECTION. Section 153.094 of the Cologne Zoning Ordinance is
added as follows:

Sec. 153.094. Conditional use permits.

(1) Purpose. Certain uses identified as conditional uses for a particular zoning district,
while generally not suitable in a particular zoning district, may under some
circumstances be suitable if conditions are attached. When such circumstances exist, a
conditional use permit may be granted. Conditions may be applied to issuance of the
permit and a periodic review of the permit may be required. The permit shall be
granted for a particular use and not for a particular person.

(2) Criteria for granting conditional use permits. In granting a conditional use permit, the
city council shall consider the advice and recommendations of the planning
commission and the effect of the proposed use upon the health, safety, morals and
general welfare of occupants of surrounding lands. Among other things, the city
council shall make the following findings where applicable:

A.

B.

The establishment, maintenance, or operation of the conditional use will not be
detrimental to or endanger the public health, safety, comfort or general welfare.

The conditional use will not be injurious to the use and enjoyment of other
property in the immediate vicinity for the purpose already permitted, nor
substantially diminish and impair property values within the neighborhood.

The establishment of the conditional use will not impede the normal and orderly
development and improvement of surrounding property for uses permitted in the
district.

Adequate utilities, access roads, drainage and necessary facilities have been or
will be provided.

Adequate measures have been or will be taken to provide ingress or egress so
designated as to minimize traffic congestion in the public streets.

The use of the property shall, in all respects other than the conditional use,
conform to the applicable regulations of the district in which it is located.

(3) Additional conditions.

A

In permitting a new conditional use or the alteration of an existing conditional use,
the city council may impose, in addition to these standards and requirements
expressly specified by this chapter, additional conditions which the planning



commission considers necessary to protect the best interest of the surrounding
area or the community as a whole. These conditions may include, but are not
limited, to the following:

a. Increasing the required zoning lot size and setback dimension.
Limiting the height, size or location of structures.
Controlling the location and number of vehicle access points.

Increasing the number of required off-street parking spaces.

b

C

d. Increasing the street width.

e

f.  Limiting the number, size, location or lighting of signs.
g

Requiring diking, fencing, screening, landscaping or other facilities to protect
adjacent or nearby property.

h.  Designating sites for open space.
i.  Placing hours of operation restrictions on the proposed use.

Any change involving structural alterations, enlargement, intensification of use, or
similar changes not specifically permitted by the conditional use permit issued
shall require an amended conditional use permit and all procedures shall apply as
if a new permit were being issued. The administrator shall maintain a record of all
conditional use permits issued including information on the use, location, and
conditions imposed by the city council, time limits, review dates, and such other
information as may be appropriate.

(4) Procedure.

A

The person applying for a conditional use permit shall fill out and submit to the
city clerk the conditional use permit application form signed by the owner, site
plan, and other such information necessary to review the application for
compliance with this Ordinance, and such submittal shall include all information
as required on the application form unless a waiver of certain information is
granted by the city clerk.

The city clerk shall determine if the application is complete and, if complete, refer
the application to the planning commission.

The planning commission shall hold a public hearing on the application. Notice of
the public hearing shall be published in the official newspaper designated by the
city at least ten days prior to the hearing. Notice of the hearing shall also be
mailed to owners of property located within 350 feet of the outside boundaries of
the land to which the conditional use will be applicable if the conditional use
permit is for an area of five acres or less. The notice shall include a description of
the land and the proposed conditional use.

The report of the planning commission shall be placed on the agenda of the city
council following referral from the planning commission. In the event that the
planning commission does not make a recommendation on an application within
60 days of the date that the application was determined to be complete under



M.S.A. § 15.99, then the application shall automatically be referred to the city
council for a public hearing if a public hearing was not previously completed by
the planning commission.

An amended conditional use permit application shall be administered in a manner
similar to that required for a new conditional use permit. Amended conditional
use permits shall include request for changes in conditions, and as otherwise
described in this chapter.

No application for a conditional use permit shall be resubmitted for the same
property and for the same type of conditional use for a period of one year from the
date of a decision of the city council to deny an application. A conditional use
permit shall expire and be considered null and void one year after it has been
issued if no construction has begun.

If a time limit or periodic review is included as a condition by which a conditional
use permit is granted, the conditional use permit may be reviewed at a hearing
with notice of said hearing provided to the current property owner of record by
first-class mail at least ten days prior to the hearing; it shall be the responsibility
of the clerk to schedule such hearings and the owner of land having a conditional
use permit shall not be required to pay a fee for said review. A hearing for annual
review of a conditional use permit may be required at the discretion of the city
council.

In the event that the any of the conditions of the CUP are violated, the city has
authority to revoke the conditional use permit.

a.  Aviolation of any condition set forth in a conditional use permit shall be a
violation of this Ordinance. If within 30 days of written notice from the city
the violation has not been corrected, the city may pursue the following
procedure to terminate the permit:

(i) Written notice of revocation shall be served upon the owner at least ten
working days prior to the Conditional Use Permit being revoked.

(if) Notice to the owner on record shall be served personally or by first class
mail. Such written notice of revocation shall contain the effective date
of the revocation, the nature of the violation constituting the basis of the
revocation, the facts which support the conclusions that a violation has
occurred and a statement that if the Owner desires to appeal, the appeal
must, within ten working days, exclusive of the day of service, file a
request for a hearing.

(iii) The hearing request shall be in writing, stating the grounds for appeal
and served personally or received by first class mail by the city clerk at
the city hall not later than 4:30 p.m. of the tenth city working day
following notice of revocation.

(iv) Following the receipt of a request for hearing, the city council shall set a
time and place for the hearing within thirty days of receipt of the
hearing request.



I.  Any use permitted under the terms of any conditional use permit shall be
established and conducted in conformity to the terms of such permit and of any
conditions designated in connection therewith. The city may, at its discretion,
review the property periodically to determine compliance with the terms of the
conditional use permit. Conditional Use Permits shall remain in effect for so long
as the conditions agreed upon are observed, provided that nothing in this section
shall prevent the city council from enacting or amending official controls to
change the status of conditional uses.

SECTION 3. EFFECTIVE DATE

This ordinance becomes effective on the date of its publication, or upon the publication of a
summary of the ordinance as provided by Minn. Stat. § 412.191, subd. 4, as it may be amended
from time to time, which meets the requirements of Minn. Stat. § 331A.01, subd. 10, as it may be
amended from time to time.

SECTION 4. REPEALER

All prior ordinances to the extent that they are inconsistent with the terms and provisions of this
Ordinance, shall be deemed repealed after the effective date of this Ordinance with regard to those
inconsistent terms and provisions.

Passed by the City Council of Cologne this day of , 2024,
Approved:
Matt Lein
Mayor

Attested:

Michelle Morrison
City Clerk

C:\Users\cnash\Dropbox\Cologne\Ordinance Amendments\2024\Nonconforming Uses\Ordinance Amend CUP and
Nonconforming usesDraftl.docx



Collaborative Planning, LLC

Memorandum

To: Honorable Mayor and Council

From: Cindy Nash, AICP, EDFP

Date: March 7, 2024

Subject: Conditional Use Permit — 209 Playhouse — Expansion of Non-Conforming Use

The City has received an application from Mr. Shambour to permit the expansion of an existing non-
conforming use. Approval of this application is contingent upon the City first adopting the ordinance
amendment related to expansion of non-conforming uses and conditional use permits.

Overview of Request

The subject property is a parcel of record containing a
building that is being used for storage. Per the application
submitted, a variance request is being made to permit the
construction of an addition to this building. A copy of the
application is attached. The architecture and floor plan for
the building was provided in the packet for consideration.
The plans show a 28.2° x 57.6° building following the
proposed addition for a total of approximately 1,624
square feet. The existing building is the only building on
the site and the principal use of the property and existing
building is for storage. The existing building is
approximately 28.2 feet by 40.2 feet for a total of
approximately 1,133 square feet. This is a proposed
increase in size of approximately 43%.

The property is zoned C-2 Central Business District and
is within the Downtown Overlay District. The property is
also within the shoreland overlay district.

Storage is not a listed permitted principal use in the C-2 Central Business District according to Section
153.039 of the Zoning Ordinance. The ordinance amendment that is also being considered would permit

the following if adopted by the City Council:

PO Box 251, Medina, MN 55340
763-473-0569



(A) The nonconforming use is not expanded or enlarged, unless approved by a Conditional Use
Permit subject to the following:

a.

The footprint of the building containing the use may be permitted to be expanded by not
more than 50% a single time. Additional expansions are not permitted. Staff Note: The
proposed expansion is 43%, which would be in compliance with this requirement.

The use is an existing legal nonconforming use. Staff note: It appears the property has
been used for this non-conforming use since prior to the original adoption of the Zoning
Ordinance in Cologne.

The proposed expansion must be in compliance with all performance standards
contained within Chapter 153 of the City Code unless a variance has been granted by
the City under the procedures set forth in Section § 153.090 . Staff Note: The
impervious surface on the property exceeds the amount permitted by ordinance, but the
property has received a variance from that requirement as the City Council was unable
to make a decision on the previous application related to this prior to the expiration of
time allowed.

The Conditional Use Permit is recorded and specifically restricts the future expansion of
the building(s) on the subject property unless the use is changed to a conforming use.

Planning Commission Recommendation

The Planning Commission recommended approval of the Conditional Use Permit subject to the

conditions in

the resolution.

PO Box 251, Medina, MN 55340 2

763-473-0569



	Binder1
	10  2024 Colgone CGPI Grant Submission 102 Lake Street West
	Submission
	Annex A-PMR LLC-Coop Offices City Revision 2.19.24
	Sheets
	A000 - LOCATION MAP, BUILDING KEY, LIFE SAFETY PLAN, CODE REVIEW
	A200 - FLOOR PLAN & RAILING DETAILS
	A300 - ENLARGED TOILET PLAN, ELEVATIONS, & TYPICAL MOUNTING HEIGHTS



	Res No 24-05 Approving an Interim Use Permit for 102 Lake Street W

	11 Memo Council non-conforming and CUP Mar2024
	12 Nonconforming Uses draft2
	Sec. 153.094. Conditional use permits.

	13 Summary for publication ordinance
	14 Ordinance Amend CUP and Nonconforming usesDraft1
	Sec. 153.094. Conditional use permits.

	15 Comment Memo Council 209 Playhouse CUP Mar2024




